

HHS/TRI-CITY FURNISHING PACKAGE
 BID GROUP SUMMARY

GROUP 1

John A. Marshall \$ 113,095.42
Herman Miller | Office Furniture, Storage, Multi-Purpose Chairs

GROUP 2

John A. Marshall \$ 4,897.54
Hightower | Lounge Furniture

GROUP 3

John A. Marshall \$ 20,195.67
Arcadia Contract | Lounge Furniture

GROUP 4

John A. Marshall \$ 17,245.33
Sit On It | Task Seating

GROUP 5

John A. Marshall \$ 79,581.60
KI | Student Seating, Activity Tables, Desk, Library Stacks

GROUP 6

John A. Marshall \$ 35,309.61
Virco | Student Seating

GROUP 7

John A. Marshall \$ 7,398.60
Safco | Student Stool and Desk

GROUP 8

John A. Marshall \$ 13,862.87
Izzy + | Reception Lounge Seating

GROUP 9

NO BID Estimate \$ 1,348.00
VS America | Student Stools

GROUP 10

NO BID Estimate \$ 2,350.00
E|R|G | Lounge Seating

GROUP 11

NO BID Estimate \$ 3,000.00
Local | Reupholster Existing

GROUP 12

Kansas Contract Design \$ 3,102.20
Clarín | Team Chairs

GROUP 13

John A. Marshall \$ 25,334.97
First Office | Teacher Desk

GROUP 14

John A. Marshall \$ 51,383.20
Hi-5 | Tables, Carrels, Activity Tables

GROUP 15

John A. Marshall \$ 12,073.28
Watson Furniture | Conference Room Tables/Credenza

GROUP 16

NO BID Estimate \$ 13,850.00
Palmieri | Study Carrels

GROUP 17

Kansas Contract Design \$ 6,702.60
Allied Plastic, Co. | Science Tables

GROUP 18

Kansas Contract Design \$ 4,840.00
Allied Scoring Tables, Inc. | Gym Scoring Table

GROUP 19

John A. Marshall \$ 1,921.66
Grescco Ltd. | Sensory Items

GROUP 20

NO BID Estimate \$ 2,809.00
School Specialty | Sensory Items

GROUP 21

Kansas Contract Design \$ 1,371.40
USA Captiol | First Aid Couch

GROUP 22

Kansas Contract Design \$ 1,551.15
Smith System | Prize Cubbie

GROUP 23

NO BID Estimate \$ 4,250.00
Metro Shelving | Wire Shelving

GROUP 24

Scott Rice \$ 352.45
Steelcase | Instructor's Chair

GROUP 25

John A. Marshall \$ 919.32
National Office Furniture | Lounge Seating

GROUP 26

John A. Marshall \$ 2,189.30
Global | Lounge Seating

GROUP 27

John A. Marshall \$ 500.40
Space Co. | Storage

BID TAB TOTAL \$ 403,828.57

No Bid Item Estimated Total \$ 27,607.00

FURNITURE BUDGET \$ 450,000.00 \$ 431,435.57